
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 11-1145

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL  

FOR: Rehabilitate Artesia Well No. 5

TIME &  

DATE: 3:00 p.m., June 29, 2011
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

 UNIT

1 LS PRICE

1. N.P.D.E.S. Permit Compliance TOTAL 6,000.00 1,500.00 NO BID

UNIT

1 LS PRICE   

2. Remove Existing Pump, Column Pipe & Video Well TOTAL 12,500.00 12,500.00 NO BID

 UNIT

1 LS PRICE

3. Development Water Transport TOTAL 15,300.00 48,000.00 NO BID

UNIT

425 LF PRICE 72.00 925.00

4. Reverse Rotary Drilling and Removal of Bentonite/Fill TOTAL 30,600.00 393,125.00 NO BID

 UNIT

12 hrs. PRICE 1,500.00 450.00

5. Well Redevelopment by Open Ended Airlifting Heavy Fluids TOTAL 18,000.00 5,400.00 NO BID

2 LS UNIT

Chemical Treatment (Perform Twice before each Well Redevelopment by Surge PRICE 12,000.00 17,000.00

6. Block and Airlift TOTAL 24,000.00 34,000.00 NO BID

90 hrs. UNIT

Well Redevelopment by Surge Block and Airlift (Perform Twich for 45 minutes PRICE 500.00 450.00

7. after each of the two chemical treatments) TOTAL 45,000.00 40,500.00 NO BID

 UNIT

1 LS PRICE   

8. Install Pump for Well Redevelopment & Testing TOTAL 12,345.00 30,000.00 NO BID

UNIT

 PRICE

9. ITEM DELETED TOTAL   

UNIT

1 hr. PRICE

10. Constant Rate Drawdown Test TOTAL 500.00 400.00 NO BID

UNIT

1 LS PRICE

11. Video Well TOTAL 5,000.00 2,000.00 NO BID

UNIT

1 LS PRICE                        

12. Reinstall Pump, Motor & Discharge Head (Purchase of Parts not included) TOTAL 26,900.00 12,500.00 NO BID

TOTAL BASE BID - LUMP SUM TOTAL 196,145.00 579,925.00 NO BID

UNIT

1 ls PRICE

13. Artesian Flow Control TOTAL 2,600.00 43,625.00 NO BID

TOTAL BASE BID PLUS ALTERNATE BID - LUMP SUM TOTAL 198,745.00 623,550.00 NO BID

Net Net

Terms 30 days 30 days

 

Delivery

 

1

 

BID INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

Alsay, Inc. Demandstar

Layne Christensen Co. SAWS Website
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